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1. Introduction 
This study focuses on the “assessing” aspect of tertiary teaching in a distance teacher education 
programme. It explores the perceptions of the role of written assessment feedback held by a cohort 
of students enrolled in The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand Diploma of Teaching (Early 
Childhood Education (a Level 7, distance teacher education programme using mixed delivery 
methods).1  

Effective teacher education improves educational outcomes for learners in tertiary institutions 
(student teachers) and for end-user learners (children) in schools and early childhood services. This 
project explores the role that written feedback (from lecturers to student teachers, after assessment of 
their work) plays in the learning and support of these students. The findings relate strategically and 
practically to other teacher education programmes—such as online programmes—by giving teacher 
educators a greater understanding of the nature and extent of written assessment feedback. Such 
feedback is likely to support student teachers to continue and complete their programmes and to lead 
them towards greater understanding of key concepts and enhanced skills. Studying aspects of 
lecturer feedback practices may stimulate discussion, reflection, and, possibly, modification of 
tertiary teaching practice (Nuthall, 2002). 

The research context 
Because the study explores the impact of written assessment feedback for distance learners, it is 
important to review the role of written assessment issues in distance education, and consider their 
effects on students. Key literature on these issues framed the development of aims, objectives, and 
research questions for this study. 

Assessment and feedback 
Feedback to students, whether oral or written, is a crucial aspect of the assessment process, and 
therefore must be considered within a broader assessment and teaching framework (Gipps, 1994).  

The term assessment is defined by Black and Wiliam (1998) as: 

all those activities undertaken by teachers, and by their students in assessing themselves, which 
provide information to be used as feedback to modify the teaching and learning activities in 
which they are engaged. (p. 2)  

Assessment can be formative, summative, or a combination of both; it may also include self-
assessment. While assessment of learning (summative assessment) remains central for employers, 
the public, and policy makers, there is growing acceptance of the potential benefits of assessment for 
learning (formative assessment) through the feedback loop (Higgins, 2004). In reality, there are both 
summative and formative elements in most feedback. This is illustrated through the widespread 
practice of tutors giving comments on written assessment tasks. While these comments are primarily 
formative, many ultimately have a summative purpose.  

Higgins (2004) reminds us that the important point to remember about feedback from formative 
assessment is that it must help students to learn. It must also form part of a continuous cycle of 
learning. To do so, it must not only give students an indication of their achievements, but, crucially, 

 
1 Mixed-mode delivery methods include: face-to-face delivery through practicums, workshops, and study 

groups; individualised lecturer support, by telephone and online; and printed learning materials. 
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provide them with information and guidance from which they can learn (Brown, 1999; Ding, 1998; 
Higgins, 2004). In doing so, feedback also has an important motivational function (Hyland, 2000). 

Biggs (1999) argues that meaning is constructed through learning activities, that teaching and 
learning must be about conceptual change, and that how students are assessed influences the quality 
of their learning. Therefore, it is important to ensure that curriculum assessment procedures and 
teaching methods are aligned, so that curriculum objectives relate to higher order cognitive thinking, 
which leads to students becoming autonomous and reflective learners who have learned how to learn 
(become deep learners) (Hyland, 2000). Black and Wiliam (as cited in Higgins, Hartley, & Skelton, 
2002) note that students are active makers and mediators of meaning within particular learning 
contexts. They emphasise the importance of interactions between teachers, pupils, and subjects for 
learning within “communities of practice”. Formative assessment, an important part of this 
alignment, provides feedback to students and gives tutors a way of checking students’ constructions. 
Students are provided with a means by which they can learn through information on their progress. 

Within the “communities of learning” associated with higher learning institutions, there are complex 
interrelationships and power differentials at work between students and tutors that temper student 
approaches to teaching and learning (Higgins, 2004). Ecclestone and Swann (1999) highlight the 
social power and status of assessment in relation to students’ anxieties over grades. They suggest 
that attempts to improve learning through formative assessment will be mediated by tutors’ and 
students’ cultural and social expectations of their roles, and their earlier educational experiences. 
Given the complex relationships and sensitivities that surround assessment, this is difficult territory 
for even the most skilled tutor to navigate. 

Mackenzie (as cited in Higgins et al., 2002) identified that written comments were often the major 
source of feedback for students. He notes that written feedback is becoming prevalent in all 
institutions, as the landscape of higher education becomes characterised by greater reliance on online 
teaching and increased workloads for lecturers. The time available for face-to-face meetings between 
student and lecturer is diminishing, and there is greater reliance on written correspondence (whether 
paper based or electronic). 

It is clear that written assessment feedback has a key role to play in the enhancement of student 
learning. This TLRI project contributes to research in this field by identifying:  

• the barriers that may undermine the potential effectiveness of feedback; and  

• what kind of feedback is likely to help students engage most effectively with learning. 

Assessment feedback in distance education 
Learner support is an important element of any teacher education programme. It is particularly 
important for learning and course completion in distance education, although what counts as support 
varies (Robinson, 1995). It may include tutoring, counselling or advising, facilitating, supporting, 
and assessing.  

In distance education programmes, lecturers have more limited opportunities to model and foster 
positive class and peer relations, question and challenge, set up simulations, and so on. 
Communication on assessment is a key opportunity for distance education lecturers to influence 
learning outcomes, by:  

• providing feedback about gaps in knowledge; 

• providing direct instruction relating to skills;  

• providing content knowledge; 

• explaining key concepts in different ways;  

• using questioning to encourage students to reflect on and explore concepts;  
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• reinforcing good information or argumentation when it has been provided; and  

• setting expectations.  

Lecturers working in a distance learning programme spend a higher proportion of time commenting 
on students’ scripts and providing written feedback than those whose teaching involves face-to-face 
delivery. The feedback process uses tools such as reflective questions, positive comments on points 
made, the provision of additional points to support student arguments, the correction of points made, 
and suggestions for further reading to enhance students’ understanding.  

Effect of assessment feedback on student learning 
Meta-analyses of effective teaching (for example, Gallimore & Tharp, 1990; Hattie, 2002) show that 
teacher practice has powerful effects on student outcomes. Effective teachers actively involve 
students in their own learning and assessment. They make learning outcomes transparent to students. 
They offer specific, constructive, and regular feedback. They ensure that assessment practices 
impact positively on students’ motivation. Alton-Lee’s (2003) best-evidence synthesis on high-
quality teaching for diverse students in schooling suggests that when assessment takes the form of 
effective and formative feedback, it is one of the most influential elements of high-quality teaching.  

Effective feedback is a key teaching influence on learning outcomes, because it functions to promote 
ongoing improvement (Brophy, as cited in Alton-Lee, 2003). It also has an important motivational 
effect on student learning through reinforcing effort and providing recognition of achievement 
(Marzano, Pickering, & Pollock, as cited in Alton-Lee, 2003). However, Alton-Lee (2003) notes that 
negative evaluation or feedback without scaffolding to resource and support student learning can 
have a negative effect on students’ motivation and engagement, and may contribute to student 
disaffection. Williams (2005) differentiates between supportive feedback and corrective feedback, 
claiming that while both are necessary, it is corrective feedback that leads to behaviour change. 
Higgins et al. (2002) found that formative assessment feedback was essential in encouraging the 
kind of “deep” learning desired by tutors.  

The identification of barriers that undermine the potential effectiveness of written assessment 
feedback, together with the lack of research in this field, provides a strong argument for further 
research on the nature of feedback for students that instils a “deep” engagement with their subject. 
Weedon (2000), when examining the congruence at The Open University between lecturer and 
student understanding of the intended meaning of feedback, found a high level of alignment between 
the two groups, and recommended more research on this topic. The areas she identified for particular 
consideration included the role and characteristics of written feedback in the co-construction of 
students’ learning. 

There appears to be little international or New Zealand research on students’ perspectives on the use 
of formative written assessment feedback. This is despite the significant position that written 
feedback comments occupy in students’ experiences and the widespread belief today that the 
purpose of assessment is to improve student learning (for example, Gipps, 1994; Higgins et al., 
2002).  
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2. Aims, objectives, and research questions  

Aims 
The aims of this research were to 

• add to the knowledge base about tertiary teaching and learning, particularly assessment practice 
in tertiary distance education; 

• enhance the links between educational research and distance teaching practices; and 

• strengthen research capability among lecturers involved in early childhood teacher education. 

Objectives 
The specific objectives were to: 

• examine students’ views on how the extent and immediacy of feedback supports their study 
and/or extends their learning; 

• identify the characteristics and methods of the feedback that students find most effective in 
supporting their study and/or extending their learning; 

• examine whether student progress and retention are linked to student views on effective feedback 
approaches for supporting and/or extending their learning; and 

• involve ECE lecturers in the research process to enhance their appreciation of evidence-based 
teaching practices and to build their research capability. 

Research questions 
• How does the extent and timing of assessment feedback to distance learners support study and 

extend learning? 

• What is the nature of the feedback that students find most effective for motivating continued 
study and/or extending their learning? 

• Why is this particular kind of feedback most effective? 

• Is there a link between student characteristics (for example, level of study or on-job experience) 
and their perceptions of the effectiveness of different feedback strategies for supporting study 
and/or extending their learning? 

Research value 
TLRI projects are required to address the following principles (Teaching & Learning Research 
Initiative, 2006): 

• address themes of strategic importance in New Zealand; 

• draw on related international work and building New-Zealand-based research evidence; 

• be forward looking; 

• recognise the central role of the teacher in learning; and 

• be undertaken as a partnership between researchers and practitioners. 
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A priority of strategic importance addressed by this project was “understanding the processes of 
teaching and learning”. The project aimed to increase understanding of an important aspect of 
pedagogical practice in distance teacher education, through its focus on the role of written 
assessment feedback in supporting and/or extending adult student learning. Pedagogical 
understanding of assessment feedback is relevant to other education providers, including distance 
education, teacher education, and tertiary providers. 

On a broader front, the timing of this project is strategically important, given that it supports 
Pathways to the Future, the early childhood strategic plan (Ministry of Education, 2002), which 
requires all early childhood teachers to have a Diploma of Teaching (Early Childhood Education) by 
2012. Teaching within Diploma of Teaching (ECE) courses must be motivational and effective to 
ensure that this upgrade is achieved within the designated timeframes. 

Distance education supports the government agenda to increase the number of qualified staff in early 
childhood education services, through providing an accessible training option to students who may 
not easily be able to access other training options—for example, rural students, students in paid 
employment, students who are parents, and students without transport. 

Writing on ways in which early childhood education training can be made more open and inclusive, 
Moss (2000) suggests that training which enables workers to go at their own pace is likely to be an 
important component of teacher training in the future. Distance education is also a preferred option 
for those Māori and Pasifika students who prefer the anonymity of distance study (Research 
Evaluation Consultancy Ltd, 2001, 2002). In line with this goal, increasing our knowledge of what 
constitutes effective written feedback for student learning will contribute to increased retentions and 
completions in distance teacher education. Thus this project also links to the strategic priorities of 
“reducing inequalities”, “addressing diversity” and “exploring future possibilities” (Teaching & 
Learning Research Initiative, 2006). 

Within The Open Polytechnic, the project will contribute to a growing research culture. In the light 
of research-based funding systems and the value placed on higher qualifications, it is important that 
staff not only undertake research, but see themselves as competent to do so.  
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3. Research design and methodology 
First, it is important to give information on who the research participants were, and the specific 
context of the programme in which they were enrolled, because the overall programme philosophy 
includes approaches to assessment and student profiles. Decisions about paradigm, methodology, 
and methods of the study were influenced by this programme context. These aspects of the research 
design are discussed, as are consideration of ethical issues and theoretical tensions. 

Participant information 

Research participants 
Students who enrol in The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand Diploma of Teaching (ECE), Level 7, 
must be at least 17 years of age, but the majority are in their 30s or 40s. The “typical” (but not 
universal) student profile is of a mature woman with family responsibilities who works in an early 
childhood centre.  

The programme has academic entry criteria and a rigorous selection process, so as to ensure that the 
prospective students are suitable for becoming teachers. The programme is a three-year, full-time, 
degree-level course that encourages students to be reflective and self-motivated. Students can live 
anywhere in New Zealand. They do written work by distance, complete practicum and home centre 
requirements close to home, and attend workshops at regional locations. 

To qualify for inclusion in this research project, the students had to be enrolled in the selected course 
and have received feedback from at least five assignments. This was to ensure that participants had 
received a sufficient amount of feedback to be able to comment on the experience. 

Relationships 
The Diploma of Teaching accreditation document states that the programme is based on the belief 
that personal and professional relationships between lecturers and students reflect the centrality of 
relationships in teaching and learning, and are modelled through the programme (The Open 
Polytechnic of New Zealand, 2002). Lecturers in this programme have a regional cohort of students 
whom they support throughout the three to six years of the programme. They were keen to engage in 
a study that would enhance the student voice and experience. 

While research tasks were mostly undertaken by the research team, the research project was seen as 
belonging to the Centre for Education Studies. All regional lecturers were involved at key points in 
the research process; they worked on the ethics proposal application and the questionnaire and focus 
group design. Section 5, “Building Capability and Capacity”, discusses participatory aspects of the 
research project, and ways in which it supported the development of a research culture.  

Programme information  

Philosophy of the programme 
The early childhood teacher has a key part to play in ensuring that “children grow up as competent 
and confident learners and communicators, healthy in mind, body and spirit, secure in their sense of 
belonging and in the knowledge that they make a valued contribution to society” (Ministry of 
Education, 1996, p. 9). 

The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand’s Diploma of Teaching (ECE) programme is grounded in the 
belief that all children are active learners, and that they are entitled to education that recognises and 
provides for their individual abilities, strengths, and challenges, whatever their cultural, social, 
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political, and economic backgrounds. The adult’s role as teacher and learner, and as a model for and 
a facilitator of children’s learning, is vitally important (see, for example, Rogoff, 1990; Smith, 1996; 
Vygotsky, 1978).  

It is essential that early childhood education teachers work supportively in a reciprocal and 
responsive manner with both children and adults, and in close partnership with parents, caregivers, 
whānau, and communities. Such relationships and partnerships serve to strengthen and empower the 
early childhood education setting, the family, and the wider community. The diploma programme 
provides student teachers with a sound understanding of the holistic nature of learning and 
development, and the diverse and individual ways in which infants, toddlers, and young children 
learn and develop.  

The pohutukawa tree, growing within the context of the wider environment, has been adopted as a 
metaphor that reflects these values and beliefs, while conveying the importance of the growing child, 
the growing student teacher, and the environment for learning. 

The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand’s Diploma of Teaching (ECE) programme is of mixed mode, 
including both distance and face-to-face components. The programme comprises three main areas,: 
reading materials, workshops, and practicums. The assignments and activities for each course are 
completed by distance, while the workshops and practicums are the face-to-face components. 
Students who study full time complete the programme in three years. In this time, each student also 
completes 14 weeks of practicum and 30 days of face-to-face workshops. The workshops cover a 
wide range of topics that complement the learning during the courses. 

There is a strong process focus on developing student teachers as competent practitioners and critical 
thinkers. The mixture of learning modes and processes in the programme ensures that student 
teachers develop critical thinking that is practical, reflective (involving research, complex concepts, 
and analyses), reasonable, and results in a belief or action (The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand, 
2002). Ennis’s (1987) taxonomy of critical thinking dispositions and abilities underpins the course 
design. 

The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand sets up supportive relationships with student teachers to 
scaffold their learning. Lecturers provide environments where dialogue can occur. Feedback loops 
foster positive attitudes towards continuous learning, through:  

• reflection about student teachers’ own practice, based on reading; 

• reflective questions posed in course materials, and reflective journal entries while on practicum; 

• regional lecturer feedback, both face to face and by email; and 

• feedback and grades when assessing student teachers’ written assignments. 

The Open Polytechnic Diploma of Teaching (ECE) endeavours to promote early childhood 
education as “not just about effective ways of learning how to implement new policies and make 
changes. It is also about legitimacy and power in the wider system, beyond the early childhood 
setting” (Carr, 2001, p. 180). 

Assessment and feedback 
The courses are designed for sequential completion, with programme-wide “threads” (such as 
bicultural issues) running through each course. Students generally complete two assignments per 
course. Courses are semesterised. Within semesters, students plan their own timetable for 
completing assignments, on the basis of the number of courses in which they have enrolled, and 
employment and personal commitments. There are few set dates beyond the end-of-semester date. 
Students are encouraged to send work in regularly, so that they receive ongoing feedback. Margrain 
(research in progress) suggests that students appreciate this flexibility—for many, it is a key reason 
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for enrolling in the programme. Many students choose to study one course at a time, and send in all 
of the work for that course before moving on to another.  

Regional lecturers in the programme have specialist areas of expertise and assess students’ work 
within their areas of expertise. Thus, all courses are effectively supported by their lecturers and 
lecturer workload is spread fairly.  

There is a system for ensuring that assessment is fair, valid, and consistent. The assessment 
regulations approved by the Academic Board state that all new courses must have a clear statement 
of the learning outcomes for the course, how these outcomes will be assessed, the standard of 
performance expected of the student, and the criteria for achievement of the course learning 
outcomes. Across the programme, moderation processes ensure that students’ work is assessed 
consistently. The first three scripts assessed by new markers are cross marked by another lecturer, 
and from that point cross marking occurs on 10 percent of scripts.  

Assignment requirements and performance criteria are clearly stated in the information given to 
students when they start their course. This information includes how and to what standard the 
outcomes will be assessed, the summative assessment procedures for the course, the grading or 
marking system that will be used, and the level of competence expected.  

Formative assessment activities allow students to practise the skills and knowledge on which they 
will be tested during summative (achievement-determining) assessment activities. Formative 
assessment activities are student directed. Methods and strategies commonly used in formative 
assessment include student-marked (self-marked) assessments with questions and answers provided, 
and phone calls or emails to a regional lecturer or specialist marker.  

Summative assessments measure performance against the learning outcomes and standards 
prescribed for the course. Students are provided with assessment criteria as a guide to completing the 
task.  

Technically, by focusing more on the skills and elements in applying knowledge within a given 
context, the assessment of abilities increases the construct validity of the task while reducing the 
quantity of testing required to achieve a reliable assessment (Clift, 1997, p. 11). 

In the diploma programme the primary means of providing students with feedback on their work and 
general learning support are the written comments on their script, and a feedback letter 
accompanying each piece of returned work. Because most students do not have regular face-to-face 
contact with regional lecturers, it is important for the written feedback to: 

• give specific technical guidance where needed 

• identify strengths and weaknesses in the student's work 

• provide recognition of the student's effort and achievement 

• encourage the student to continue with his/her study 

• recognise the student as an individual. (The Open Polytechnic, 2002, p. 26)  

Assessment feedback should also explain how the content of the student’s work meets the learning 
outcomes of the assignment, and suggest where to find additional information. 

A standards-based model of assessment is used, whereby the feedback is included on a generic 
feedback letter that covers the four elements for which marks are awarded. These areas include 
content (50 percent), supporting evidence (30 percent), structure (10 percent), and presentation (10 
percent). Criterion referencing fits into each grade level of this model to provide clear, fair, and 
consistent descriptions of the multiple variables that need to be considered, assessed, and pulled 
together (Wolf, as cited in New Zealand Qualifications Authority, 1991) to provide sufficient 
evidence to infer competence at a particular level.  
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Students in The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand Diploma of Teaching (ECE) are required to 
demonstrate competence in all learning outcomes, which means they must pass all assignments (gain 
at least 50 percent). Work given a grade of 40–49 percent may be resubmitted for a maximum grade 
of 50 percent, but there is only one opportunity for resubmitting work for each course. 

Because of the importance in maintaining student motivation of returning work promptly, 
turnaround time is important. The standard performance indicator for turnaround time at The Open 
Polytechnic is 10 working days from receipt in the faculty to return to the mailroom.  

Research design 

Epistemology and paradigm 
Interpretivism is an epistemological perspective that is relevant to this study, because it holds that 
facts and values are not distinct, and findings are inevitably influenced by the researcher’s 
perspectives and values. It is thus not possible to conduct entirely objective, value-free research, 
although the researcher can declare and be transparent about his or her assumptions (Snape & 
Spencer, 2003, p. 17). 

The researchers acknowledge that their own values may have influenced the interpretation of the 
data, but this influence was alleviated in two ways. First, the facilitators of the focus groups were 
independent of the programme. Secondly, and as a result of the pilot study evaluation, the language 
used in the questionnaire was adjusted to be more meaningful for participants. 

This study includes elements of both participatory and constructivist paradigm positions (Lincoln & 
Guba, 2000). Links to the participatory position include: 

• “goodness of quality criteria”, where the understanding comes from more than one source 
(questionnaire and focus group discussions) with purposeful research that will lead to positive 
change; 

• “values”, where the focus group input is valued; 

• “inquirer posture/voice”, where the primary voice of the student is manifested through 
completion of the questionnaire and participation in focus group discussions, even though the 
researchers have chosen the primary voice; and 

• “training”, where Dr Anne Meade assumes a role of mentor/support, input from the advisory 
group is valued, and the researchers are working as a team, with each research team member 
contributing their individual skills (Lincoln & Guba, 2000, p. 170–171).  

The constructivist paradigm position is also evident in our research. To support this view, the study 
is looking at what is real, what is useful, and what has meaning for students (Lincoln & Guba, 2000) 
in relation to feedback, through the interpretation of interviews and questionnaires. Lincoln & Guba 
(2000) suggest that making sense of the findings will shape action, which in this instance will lead to 
improved practice by lecturers. Denscombe (2003, p. 76) states, “The crucial points about the cycle 
of inquiry in action research are (a) that the research feeds directly back into practice, and (b) that 
the process is ongoing” (italics in the original). Because of its participatory nature, therefore, this 
study reflects some elements of action research, particularly when the practical recommendations 
from the findings are implemented in future practice.  

The research is “mixed research”, including both quantitative and qualitative methods. The 
questionnaire was composed of multiple closed questions (quantitative) and several open-ended 
questions (qualitative), whereas the focus group interviews provided solely qualitative data. 
According to Cresswell (2003), current research practice, rather than be simply quantitative or 
qualitative in nature, focuses on the continuum between the two. Burns (2000) concurs, and 
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comments on the need for both approaches, “since no one methodology can answer all questions and 
provide insights on all issues” (p. 11).  

Methodology 
The key methodology of the study is survey research. This form of research is particularly useful for 
studies that want to find out something (including thoughts, values, and attitudes) about or from a 
particular group of people, and is widely used in educational research (Fowler, 1993; Keeves, 1997; 
Neuman, 1997; Seale, 2004; Williams, 2003). According to Denscombe (2003), survey research 
includes the characteristics of “wide and inclusive coverage”, research that is undertaken “at a 
specific point in time”, and “empirical research” (p. 6).  

The methods used were: 

(a) a postal questionnaire, sent to all students enrolled in the programme who had completed at 
least five assignments; 

(b) three focus-group interviews; and 

(c) analysis of student records.  

Students could participate any or all of these aspects of the research, or could decline to take part. 

Ethics approval for the research was provided by the Joint Ethics Committee2 in March 2003. 

Research methods 

Questionnaire 

A 13-page questionnaire was developed (see Appendix 1), based on literature relating to the research 
questions. The questionnaire included closed and open questions. The development of this 
instrument was informed by feedback from regional lecturers, The Open Polytechnic’s TLRI 
Advisory Committee, the Ethics Committee, and a statistician. A pilot of the entire survey process 
was completed before the final survey commenced, feedback from which influenced the 
questionnaire’s presentation and language in particular. The pilot sample was chosen by selecting 
every numerical multiple of a particular number from the master list of eligible students. 

All students who had completed five or more assignments and who had been active within the past 
year (excluding those who had received the pilot) were sent questionnaires. However, further into 
the semester a review of the master list highlighted that a number of students had withdrawn or not 
proceeded with their enrolment, meaning that they had now been inactive for two or more 
semesters.3 These students were subsequently deleted from the master list, reducing the number of 
eligible students who had been sent questionnaires to 237.  

Strategies for enhancing the return rate included: two sets of reminder letters; verbal reminders at 
workshops, study groups, and other times when lecturers were in contact with students; and two 
notices in the student newsletter. In addition, spare copies of questionnaires were provided at two 
programme workshops. These strategies supported the return of 125 questionnaires with signed 
permission forms,4 a return rate of 53 percent. 

 
2 The Joint Ethics Committee is a committee representing The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand, the 

Wellington Institute of Technology, and Whitireia Polytechnic. 
3 Programme regulations state that the centre manager can grant leave of absence from the programme for one 

semester. 
4 A small number of additional questionnaires were returned without signed permission forms. These could not 

be used in the research. 
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The questionnaire was presented in the form of a stapled booklet, printed on green paper with a logo 
representing “wise” research. The colour coding and logo were also used for the reminder letters and 
feedback to students. Questionnaires were despatched by mail (see Appendix 1), along with an 
information sheet (Appendix 2), consent form (Appendix 3), and reply-paid envelope. The returned 
questionnaires, consent forms, and questionnaires were coded with a matching number. The numbers 
were allocated in order of date of receipt, beginning with A1 for questionnaires received before 
written reminders were sent out, B1 for questionnaires received after reminder but by the requested 
date, and C1 for questionnaires received after the requested date but in time to be included in the 
research analysis. 

Focus groups 

Focus groups provided an opportunity to discuss issues raised in the questionnaire in greater depth. 
Three focus groups were formed: one of students of Māori descent, and two general groups. Of the 
two general groups, one comprised students from an urban area where regional lecturers are 
accessible,5 and the other was made up of students from a provincial area where no regional lecturer 
is based. Once the locations were identified, all eligible students within the relevant geographic areas 
were invited. Group size ranged from 6 to 15 students.  

Focus group questions (see Appendix 4) were compiled after a preliminary analysis of the 
questionnaire had been completed. People who had knowledge of the programme, but who had not 
been markers for the courses in which students were enrolled, facilitated the focus groups. Dr Anne 
Meade provided training in focus group facilitation for the facilitators and also the wider lecturing 
team, as professional development in research. 

Two of the focus groups were held on a Saturday afternoon, and one on a Monday evening. 
Attendance ranged from 1 to 7 students. The meetings took between 1.5 and 2 hours, including 
“meet and greet” time. Refreshments were provided, and petrol vouchers for reimbursement of 
travel. Students had been posted additional information forms for the focus group phase (see 
Appendix 5), and signed additional consent forms at the focus group (see Appendix 6). For two of 
the focus groups, the numbers attending were lower than desired (n = 1 and 2), but more students (n 
= 7) attended the third focus group. 

Each focus group was managed by two facilitators, one of whom facilitated the discussion while the 
other recorded written notes and provided support. The facilitators held a debriefing session 
immediately after the focus group meeting, and notes were prepared promptly. A further debriefing 
session for all three focus group meetings, attended by one facilitator from each focus group, was 
held within a few weeks. 

Student records 

When completing the consent form for participation in the questionnaire, students were asked if they 
also consented to their academic records being accessed. For those who provided permission, 
academic results (course completion dates and grades) were examined, giving a measure of 
comparison between achievement and questionnaire responses. Particularly useful variables from the 
academic records were grade and pace (see under “Qualitative analysis”, below).6 It was 
hypothesised that these factors may affect the value students placed on their written feedback, their 
reflection, and their motivation. 

 
5 At the time of this study, regional lecturers of The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand Diploma of Teaching 

(ECE) were based in Kaikohe, Whangarei, Hamilton, Tauranga, Rotorua, Hastings, Palmerston North, and 
Dunedin, the Auckland and Christchurch business centres, and the main campus in Lower Hutt.  

6 Pace varies because students in the programme can self-nominate how many courses they wish to study in any 
semester, providing they complete the programme in no less than three and no more than six years. 
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Data analysis 

Qualitative analysis 
Qualitative data were manually analysed using thematic analysis, in particular “constant comparative 
analysis” (LeCompte & Preissle, cited in Mutch, 2005). The steps used in this approach to analysis include: 

• perceiving; 

• comparing—same as/finding similarities; 

• contrasting; 

• aggregating and labelling; 

• ordering; 

• establishing linkages and relationships; and 

• speculating—tentative theorising.  

Sections of qualitative data from the questionnaires were analysed by three of the research team, 
each of whom searched for emerging categories from the data. The three researchers collaborated to 
ensure that labelling and categorisation were consistent. The focus-group data were analysed by one 
researcher, also using the thematic analysis approach. Two of the research team worked together to 
review questionnaires from students who identified as Māori, in order to consider issues of particular 
relevance to this group of students. The full research team provided feedback and discussion on the 
themes for each data set. 

Quantitative analysis 
Statisticians from the New Zealand Council for Educational Research constructed two variables 
from questionnaire and academic records: 

• pace—the speed at which students are working through the required courses. The three categories 
created were: slow, medium and fast; and 

• achievement—the letter grades of students. The three categories created were: low, medium and high. 

Pace was constructed by identifying the number of courses each student had completed (passed with 
A, B, or C grades). It represented the number of courses passed in total, divided by 1 for Year 1 
students, by 2 for Year 2 students, and by 3 for Year 3 students.7 This gave a well distributed 
variable (Appendix 7 gives tables showing excerpts from the data) that could be usefully 
transformed into the three categories: slow, medium, and fast.  

An overall achievement variable was created by taking, for each student, the total number of A 
passes multiplied by 3, the total number of B passes multiplied by 2, and the total number of C 
passes multiplied by 1. These were added together and divided by 1 for Year 1 students, by 2 for 
Year 2 students, and by 3 for Year 3 students, to form a common scale across all students. This 
variable also had acceptable distribution (see Appendix 7 for an excerpt) and could be grouped into 
low, medium, and high.  

The statistical procedures used in relation to these two constructed variables showed acceptable 
dispersal across the pace and achievement categories (see above) for each year group. The two 
constructed variables were useful for cross tabulating against other survey responses.  

 
7 Because students can choose how many courses they wish to study in any semester, for many students the 

classifications ”Year 1”, ”Year 2” and ”Year 3” refer to their level of study (Levels 5, 6, and 7 on the New 
Zealand Qualifications Framework) rather than the number of years they have been enrolled in the 
programme. For example, a Year 3 student may be in her fifth year of study, and a Year 2 student in her 
fourth. 
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Ethical issues 
It is important in any research project to consider ethical issues. In this project, we were particularly 
mindful that our students were being invited to participate, and that it was important that they did not 
feel imposed on or coerced. Information letters clearly stated that participation was voluntary. 

A second ethical issue for students was that we asked for access to their student records. It was 
important that students understood that all research information would remain confidential, and that 
the records data would be aggregated, rather than attributed to particular individuals. 

There was extensive discussion within the research team and the polytechnic’s TLRI Advisory 
Committee about who would facilitate the focus groups. Early in the project, it was envisaged that 
regional lecturers would be invited to participate, as part of our focus on building research 
capability. The TLRI Advisory Committee wisely suggested that this might compromise the data, in 
that students would be more likely to speak frankly about their assessment feedback to people who 
were not themselves markers in the programme. For this reason, we arranged for facilitators who 
knew about the programme content and philosophy, but were not current or previous markers of the 
courses. We offered training in focus group facilitation skills for regional lecturers, in order to 
contribute research support to our wider team. 

We firmly believe that the participants should benefit from the research. The students have all been 
sent interim feedback. A copy of the final report will go to all participants who are currently 
enrolled, as well as to those who have since left the programme, but who indicated on their 
permission forms that they would like to receive a copy of the report. In addition to providing 
feedback, this shows students that their lecturers are also learners. We also have an ethical obligation 
to discuss and consider findings from the research, in terms of how we can improve our pedagogical 
practice and institutional systems to support students as well as possible. We intend to do this in a 
forum at an internal conference in March 2006, and by providing copies of the report to strategic 
staff within our organisation. 

Theoretical tensions 
The underlying philosophy of the Diploma of Teaching (ECE) programme claims to be sociocultural 
(The Open Polytechnic, 2002). While some aspects of the programme (such as workshops, 
practicum, home centre requirements and formative assessment) fit into the sociocultural realm, the 
programme also includes other central aspects that are constructivist rather than sociocultural. These 
aspects include the use of summative assignments. The assessment procedures are governed by 
procedures that are used in the wider Polytechnic throughout other courses, and by the mode of 
study, which is distance learning. The researchers therefore acknowledge that there is a tension 
between the philosophy of the programme and the assessment procedures. In addition, there is a 
strong programme commitment to building relationships with students. These supportive, nurturing 
relationships, however, are in tension with unequal power relationships—including the ability of 
lecturers to grade and fail their students. 

Within our research project we aimed to support sociocultural philosophy and use a participatory 
paradigm. Because of practicalities, however, we used a questionnaire that was largely quantitative. 
In some respects the tension between our use of quantitative method and our desire to qualitatively 
interpret and understand the data mirrored the tension within the programme. To some extent this 
was mediated by our use of additional qualitative methods (the facilitation of focus group interviews, 
and the open-ended questions in the questionnaire) and by our consultation with many parties in the 
creation of the questionnaire (including the pilot process).  



 

4. Findings 
Discussion of the research findings is divided into four sections. The first deals with student profile 
and progress, including demographics, reasons for studying, and the constructed variables of pace 
and achievement. The next three sections—content of feedback, systems, and motivation—cover 
themes that emerged from the data. Students raised four issues dealing with the content of feedback: 
support to improve; change over time; justification of grades; and reflection and links from theory to 
practice. In the “systems” section, students discussed script return, consistency of marking, their own 
understanding of the written feedback provided, and how it was useful to them. The final section 
considers issues linked to motivation: the type of feedback given; the use of grades; and 
relationships. 

Student profile and progress 

Demographics 
The students participating in this study were asked to identify their year of study, age, ethnic group, 
first language, how long it had been since they had undertaken study before enrolling in the 
programme, and their highest qualification, both at school and since leaving school. Information was 
also collected from their student files held at The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand. Student 
profiles are shown in Figures 1, 2, and 3 and in Table 1. The majority of students in this programme 
were over 30 years of age and had last studied more than 5 years previously. It is important for 
organisations such as the Ministry of Education and the New Zealand Teachers’ Council to consider 
the views of this group of mature learners. Student teachers in other institutions may be dominated 
by younger students, such as 18–20-year-old school leavers.  

Figure 1 shows that half of the research sample consisted of Year 2 students. This can partly be 
explained by the fact that the Diploma of Teaching (ECE) is a recently accredited programme 
growing in size each year, so that there are more students in Year 2 than Year 3, and more in Year 1 
than in Year 2. However, those Year 1 students who had not yet received feedback from five 
assignments at the time of the study were not eligible to participate.  

Figure 1 Year of study 

24%

50%

25%

1%

Year One

Year Two

Year Three

Did not Indicate

 (
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Figure 2 Age of participants 

22%

77%

1%

30 years and under
Over 30 years
Did not indicate

 
 
Figure 3 How long since study was last undertaken before entering Diploma of Teaching 

(ECE) programme 

25%

27%

46%

2%
Within the last two
years
In the last two to five
years
More than five years
ago
Did not respond

 
 
The survey asked students to identify their first language (see Table 1). These results were cross 
tabulated with their year of study. Students with first languages other than English were more 
numerous in Year 2.  
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Table 1 Languages, by year level 

 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 

 (No.) (%) (No.) (%) (No.) (%) 

English 30 100.0 49 77.7 27 87.1 

Pacific Island 0  3 4.8 1 3.2 

Other 0  11 17.5 3 9.7 

Total 30 100.0 63 100.0 31  100.0 

 

Reasons for studying 
The main reasons for deciding to study for a Diploma of Teaching (ECE) were personal. A total of 
91 percent of all students (100 percent of Year 1 students) said the love of children was a very 
important or important reason for studying, and 90 percent said their wish to be an early childhood 
teacher was very important or important to them. The impact on individuals or ECE centres of 
government regulations relating to staff qualifications was rated as an important or very important 
reason by 50 to 60 percent of those who answered the survey. There were no significant differences 
between students at different year levels for any of the reasons cited.  

While the number is not statistically significant, it is worth noting that a higher proportion of Year 3 
students said that studying for a qualification was important or very important for keeping their jobs.  

Pace and achievement 
Data from students’ academic records held at The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand were analysed 
using the constructed variables of pace and achievement. The results are given in Table 2 gives the 
results of pace, by year level; Table 3 shows achievement, by year level; and Table 4 shows pace, by 
achievement. 

Table 2 Pace, by year level 

 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 

 (No.) (%) (No.) (%) (No.) (%) 

Slow 14 46.7 10 16.1 0  

Medium 14 46.7 42 67.8 21 72.4 

Fast 2 6.7 10 16.1 8 27.6 

Total  100.0 62 100.0 29 100.0 

N/R = 3; df = 4; Chi-square = 22.86; p  < 0.0001 

The higher the year level, the greater the proportion of high achievers. However, the increase in pace 
across year levels cannot be accounted for simply by poorly achieving students dropping out of the 
programme, because there were relatively high completion rates at all levels.8 No Year 1 students in 
the sample had gained a D or E grade (none of these failing students chose to complete the 
questionnaire). 

                                                        

8 The completion rate for the Diploma of Teaching (ECE) in semester 2, 2004 was 85 percent overall: 80 
percent for Year 1 courses, 82 percent for Year 2 courses, and 88 percent for Year 3 courses (plus 92 
percent for workshops and 85 percent for practicum).  
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Table 3 Achievement, by year level 

 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 

 (No.) (%) (No.) (%) (No.) (%) 

Low 8 26.7 8 12.9 0  

Medium 17 56.7 47 75.8 22 75.9 

High 5 16.7 7 11.3 7 24.1 

Total 30 100.0 62 100.0 29 100.0 

N/R = 3 ; df = 4; Chi-square = 11.21; p = 0.0244. 

Cross tabulation of the two constructed variables, pace and achievement, resulted in an association 
that is statistically significant. High achievers are moving through their courses at a faster pace than 
low achievers. There are important implications here for tertiary study policy, including teacher 
education. Students benefited from having less than a full-time load in their first year while they 
learned the programme expectations. Assessment feedback contributed to their growing 
understanding of required conventions, underpinning philosophy and technical skills. Assessment 
feedback is particularly relevant for this particular cohort of students, many of whom had not studied 
at a tertiary level before. Students were then able to pick up the pace and manage a greater number 
of courses while achieving good grades. Their success is particularly remarkable, given that most 
were also working and supporting families. Thus it is important that once students are “flying” we 
respect their ability to make decisions about their workload—increasing workload does not 
necessarily correlate negatively with grades. It is, however, critically important that students are well 
supported in the early stages of their programme, and that our structures are not so rigid as to require 
students to complete a 3-year programme in equal thirds.  

Table 4 Pace, by achievement 

 Low achievement Medium High achievement 

 (No.) (%) (No.) (%) (No.) (%) 

Slow pace 12 75.0 12 14.0 0  

Medium pace 4 25.0 65 75.5 8 42.1 

Fast pace 0  9 10.5 11 57.9 

Total 16 100.0 86 100.0 19 100.0 

df = 4; Chi-square = 6.11; p  < 0.0001 

Using the student record data, the constructed variables were also cross tabluated with written 
feedback variables. The researchers found that technical aspects of written feedback were 
significantly associated with both pace and achievement. Those who said that these aspects of 
feedback were very important and useful to them were likely to be both fast paced and high 
achievers. 

Content of feedback  
The researchers have referred to two categories of feedback: global feedback and technical feedback. 
Feedback in relation to sentence structure, paragraphing, essay format, APA referencing, and 
presentation is defined as “technical” feedback. All other feedback is referred to as “global” 
feedback. 
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The study showed that there is a general consensus that all written feedback, both technical and 
global, plays an important or very important role in helping students to improve their written work. It 
also aids in providing the links from theory to practice that are so important in a teacher education 
programme. Studies of undergraduate university students undertaken by Hyland (2000) and 
Orsmond, Merry, and Reiling (2002) found that students believed strongly in the potential value of 
written feedback, copnsidering that it not only enhanced both motivation and learning, but also 
encouraged reflection and clarified understandings.  

Progress 
Results from the survey showed that for over 80 percent of the students all written comments (global 
and technical), whether on the script or in the feedback letter, were most informative, and were 
considered to be important or very important in helping them to improve their work.  

It helps to see where I need to improve … helps me to learn something new or look at 
something in a different way. (Questionnaire9) 

Ticks on the script were important or very important for improving work for 63 percent of students 
surveyed.  

The ticks on the script are interesting. Most markers use them to emphasise agreement and put 
ticks over relevant phrases. I like this simple strategy. (Questionnaire) 

However, 34 percent felt neutral or considered ticks not at all important:  

Ticks on the script give you confidence but they don’t help you to improve. I had a module 
with ticks everywhere and only got a B+. If my work was so good, why didn’t I get an A? 
(Questionnaire) 

Many students, both in the survey and in focus group interviews, reported that they found the 
feedback on technical aspects of their writing to be extremely useful. Such feedback reportedly 
“taught” essay structure, paragraphing, APA referencing, sentence structure, grammar, and spelling:  

Referencing correctly. It was helpful because I didn’t repeat my mistakes and therefore I could 
learn to reference almost perfectly. (Questionnaire)  

I found feedback very helpful on structure of essays especially when I first started. [My 
lecturer] was really good at telling me where things go, and grammar too. Now I know. In the 
early stages it’s really good. (Focus group10) 

Conversely, some students felt that feedback focused too much on technical aspects, and was 
“picky” and pedantic: 

I received high grade (90–95 percent) but was dismayed as to why small technical aspects were 
highlighted by the tutor. (Focus group)  

One marker focussed on four full stops in my assignment—couldn’t see the value in that. 
(Focus group)  

Students found feedback on assignments that required resubmission to be positive and supportive, 
and felt that they were given specific guidance on how to pass:  

Feedback comments are outlined clearly on areas required to resubmit. Usually the marker 
gives clear explanation on what they want us to cover. (Questionnaire) 

 
9 Questionnaire codes were tracked (for example, A12), but have not been reported here. 
10 To protect confidentiality, comments from the three focus groups have not been separated. 
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I found the resubmit feedback very helpful. The marker clearly explained what needed to be 
done before resubmitting my assignment. (Questionnaire) 

No students stated that feedback was “not important”. There appear to be statistically significant 
differences between year level groups in relation to the usefulness of feedback to students (that is, 
whether “important” or “very important”), although these relationships are non-linear. A large 
majority of Year 1 students rated feedback as “very important”. There is a drop in the percentage of 
Year 2 students saying this; the percentage increases again for Year 3 students.  

There were some differences in the way feedback was used by different year levels and ages of 
students. Advice about presentation (a technical aspect of feedback) was considerably more 
important for Year 1 students than for the more experienced. Older students (over 30 years) appear 
to differ significantly in their use of the comments on the script to improve future assignments.  

Table 5 and Table 6 illustrate the importance of “global” feedback and “technical” feedback 
respectively to the different year levels. 

Table 5 Usefulness of “global feedback”, by year level 

 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 

 (No.) (%) (No.) (%) (No.) (%) 

Important 1 3.3 24 38.1 9 29.0 

Very important 29 96.7 39 61.9 22 71.0 

Total 30 100.0 63 100.0 31 100.0 

df = 2; Chi-square = 15.8210; p < 0.0004  

 

Table 6 Usefulness of “technical feedback”, by year level 

 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 

 (No.) (%) (No.) (%) (No.) (%) 

Important 0   15  23.8 4 12.9 

Very important 30 100.0 48 76.2 27 87.1 

Total 30 100.0 63 100.0 31 100.0 

df = 2; Chi-square = 9.0658; p = 0.01 

The literature suggests that there is enormous variation in whether, and to what extent, tutors 
respond to students’ writing. Assessing students and providing feedback result in divergent practices, 
characterised by variations in the qualitative and quantitative comments that tutors provide on course 
work assignments (Ding, 1998; Higgins, 2004; Hounsell, 1987). These assessment practices may 
vary from being authoritarian, judgemental, and detached (Connors & Lunsford, 1993) to being 
personal and empathetic.  

Change over time 
Students reported that feedback changed as they progressed in the programme—the feedback they 
received at the beginning differed from that received midway through or towards the end. Students 
mostly indicated that this was appropriate and reflected responsiveness to their changing needs. 
Whether the feedback was more affirming at the early or later stages may depend on individual 
student competency: 
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I guess as we move on in levels I expect that the comments will get more challenging. (Focus 
group)  

Now the comments have changed because I’m learning. (Focus group)  

Written feedback at the beginning of the programme was more informative compared to later 
in the programme … more corrective than supportive [towards the end]. (Focus group)  

Some aspects of feedback may not have changed; students referred to ongoing encouragement and 
affirmation, and also to the consistent nature of comments:  

The comments have remained positive as I’ve moved on. (Focus group)  

Repetitive comments from lecturers from assignment to assignment. (Focus group) 

Studies suggest that many students experience difficulties with written work in their first year, that 
they have difficulty knowing what tutors want, and that different tutors within the same discipline 
may have different requirements. These difficulties are compounded for students moving between 
courses, who find different conceptions (depending on the discipline) of what essays and essay 
writing are about. This experience can lead to anxiety and uncertainty (Drew, 2001; Hartley & 
Chesworth, 2000; Hounsell, 1987; Hartley, 1980; McCune, 1999).  

Justification 
It is clear that students want justification as to why they receive a particular grade, especially if the 
grade is low. They felt at times there was inconsistency between affirming feedback comments and 
the lower grade received:  

Sometimes the comments may be glowing, but then the mark is 6 out of 10 …. markers don’t 
say why you got 6 out of 10. (Focus group) 

If all comments are positive, then why don’t the marks reflect positive? (Focus group)  

Justification of the grade is personally vital for my own self improvement. (Questionnaire) 

Students suggested that written feedback would improve if markers were more specific, clarified 
points, and justified what they said or did:  

When they tick sometimes a comment, as they think that aspect is important, or they could 
expand on why or how they agree or disagree is helpful. (Questionnaire)  

Always show how marks could be improved. I consistently read that my work is very good but 
I don’t see this in the mark. How do I get the extra 20 percent? Needs feedback for 
improvement. (Questionnaire) 

Orsmond et al. (2002) noted that students seem to be frustrated by feedback that identifies their 
weaknesses, but does not tell them how these might be addressed. Students also showed a desire for 
guidance in advance of assignments, to help them to know what tutors expect and what particular 
assignments require of them. These responses suggest that feedback that is merely judgemental and 
evaluative rather than developmental may be seen as of limited use by students who want to know 
how to improve (Higgins, 2004). 

Reflection and links from theory to practice 
Many students commented on the links between assessment feedback and their professional practice 
as early childhood teachers. They acknowledged that learning was an ongoing process, not limited to 
particular courses: 

They (the tutors) are probably looking for something different from a reflection. For example, 
“I’d take that waiata back to my centre and incorporate into our next programme planning 
cycle”. (Focus group)  
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I’d try and use the same terminology in my work as is used in my courses—this makes it very 
relevant. (Focus group)  

It is important to have correct technical aspects for use in making profile books to reflect our 
professionalism. (Focus group) 

I’m a critical thinker but I’m still learning. (Focus group) 

One student reported that she had been told to “take from it what you want to” in relation to the 
course, which she found more empowering that trying to focus on what she thought the marker 
wanted (focus group). 

Some students indicated that they felt uncomfortable with personal or reflective aspects of 
assignments being graded: 

I get confused if I get asked for and give my opinion and then get a bad mark. How can I get a 
bad mark for my opinion? (Focus group) 

They also questioned whether high academic grades necessarily reflected good quality practice:  

I don’t believe that getting an “A” mark makes you a better early childhood teacher. (Focus 
group)  

It was also noted that finding the time to be truly reflective is a challenge for busy students who 
work, have family commitments, and study:  

Time is an issue to be reflective. (Focus group) 

Systems 
The Open Polytechnic has systems to ensure validity and reliability in marking. Focus group 
discussion indicated that students generally understand and accept these systems.  

Script return  
In this study the approach that students took to completing courses, and therefore assignments, 
affected both the way they used the feedback and its usefulness (Higgins, 2004). A submission 
pattern within the Diploma of Teaching (ECE) is that students often choose to submit both 
assignments of a course together, or soon after each other, so that they receive within-course 
feedback less often. They usually complete courses “one at a time” (consecutively) within a 
semester, rather than having “several on the go” (concurrently). Thus, by the time feedback from one 
course arrives, students usually have begun the next course. Over 90 percent of students responding 
to the survey said that it took 3–4 weeks or longer to have their marked scripts returned to them. 
Most considered this too long, especially if they were waiting for the feedback before starting on 
their next assignment:  

Four weeks is too long. I start to get concerned especially if I need Assessment 1 back to 
complete Assessment 2. (Questionnaire) 

Research by Ding (1998) suggests that students may not get enough time to act upon feedback 
comments. With the prevalence of modularised courses, it is likely that students may often have 
moved onto a new topic by the time they receive their feedback, which can limit the effectiveness of 
the feedback. 

Survey and focus group data from this study showed that students were frustrated when there were 
delays in returning their work, as they appreciate being affirmed and encouraged. While some 
students like to wait for the feedback before starting their next assignment, they recognise that their 
progress would be very slow if they did wait: 
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I just carry on with assessments. If I waited for scripts to come back, my progress would be 
very slow. I deal with a resubmit if and when I get one. (Focus group) 

A few students are resigned to the waiting time and have found it does not impede them:  

It takes a while, but I’m only impatient to know how I have fared. I don’t find it hinders me 
from starting my next assessment. (Focus group) 

If students do wait for feedback before starting their next assignment, it is either a requirement of the 
assignment task or for guidance, “because if you need to make changes to the first assignment it is 
pointless in starting the next one if you don’t know what the changes are” (survey).  

Internal moderation processes also impact on script turnaround time, as some students find this an 
added delay. Some students felt that their scripts had been used for moderation more often than other 
students’ scripts, even though selection is generally random. 

My first one was sent to mediation [moderation]. My second took ages as it was left on a 
marker’s desk. My third was again misplaced. (Questionnaire) 

These systems do ensure inter-marker reliability. However, students still questioned the consistency 
of marking. 

Consistency 
Students perceived differences in the way markers responded to their writing. Issues of consistency 
between markers recur in many comments, from students’ initial thoughts on feedback to ways 
feedback could be improved.  

Markers are all different and I don’t find it encouraging …. For example in my first year I was 
told to write one point per paragraph but then a marker disputed this when I put it into practice. 
I now wonder if I have been given the correct information in the first place. (Focus group) 

Transparent criteria were also important to ensure validity and consistency in marking. Despite 
assessment guidelines being structured to promote consistent formative feedback, there will 
inevitably be pressures and scope to operate “beyond” the assessment guidelines that tutors are 
presented with. This positioning suggests that different teachers will evaluate work in different ways, 
and may give different advice and guidance. Black and Wiliam (1998) argue that these differences 
matter little if the resultant feedback leads to gains in learning. Students, however, prefer to see 
consistency between markers:  

I’d been told by markers that if I’d gone over the word limit I would have got a better mark. 
I’ve really resented this as I felt I had to be concise to the designated word length. I’d just be 
getting confident when the marker changed and the next one has a different style of marking. 
My style had not changed—marker had—then my marks changed! (Focus group)  

Processing feedback  
The majority of students (89 percent) indicated that they open their feedback when it is first 
received. From survey results, 76 percent of students always or usually read it carefully, whereas 21 
percent skim-read it. A large number of students (78 percent) take up to half an hour to read their 
feedback, while a few (14 percent) read it in less than five minutes. Questions about feedback were 
cross tabulated with age groups, and most of these results were not statistically significant. However, 
there appears to be a difference for older students (over 30 years) in relation to what they do first 
with written feedback: they read the feedback carefully.  

A large majority (87 percent) read the mark first, but two thirds of the students (77 percent) rarely 
look at the mark only. Half the students indicated that they read the comments on the script last.  



 

The order in which written feedback is read varies according to different year levels. In the case of 
Year 1 students, a large majority read the mark first (93 percent, compared with 80 percent of Year 3 
students). General and specific feedback letter comments were read second or later by most students, 
with nearly 20 percent of Year 3 students going to the letter first.  

Figure 4 illustrates that, if students received feedback they did not understand, or if they had 
difficulty in actioning suggestions made in the feedback, their most likely action would be to contact 
the marker. However, only half the students said they would contact the marker; the next most likely 
action was to contact their regional lecturer. This highlights the value students place on the 
relationship they have with their regional lecturer. Zepke et al. (2005) affirm the importance of 
“fostering positive relationships between students and significant others in the institution” (p. 17). 
Some students would instead talk to family members, support persons, colleagues, or other students, 
while a few would take no action at all.  

Figure 4 Action when feedback is not understood (by responses) 
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Most students indicated that they would call lecturers and markers when they wanted clarification of 
their work: 

I ring to understand the question. (Focus group)  

Students commented on telephone, email and face-to-face access to staff, but did not always say who 
was contacted. The telephone was a popular method, although several students commented that 
email was useful because they “can use it anytime” (focus group). 

I find that easy, I email [my lecturer] to ask and then I can save it and read it. (Focus group) 

A few students felt that they should be independent and were reluctant to call. Some “felt they 
should know the answer without any help” because distance students had all the materials that they 
needed in front of them (focus group). Other students indicated that they contacted the Open 
Polytechnic staff only when it was critically important. One student clarified these times, saying “at 
the very end” when she was desperate, or about administration issues (focus group). 
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Some students could not find contact numbers, or did not know whom to call, even though this 
information was given to them. Thus, the difficulty of contacting the organisation was more 
frustrating: 

Sometimes it’s hard to get hold of them and when you are pressured for time, you know, you 
hit a problem, you want help now. It means you can’t get on with it. This is your only time to 
do it. (Focus group) 

Tossed around and moved from person to person when contacting … by telephone. (Focus 
group) 

Use of feedback 
Learner support is an important element of any teacher education programme. It is particularly 
important for learning and course completion in distance education, though what counts as learner 
support varies (Robinson, 1995). McKenzie (as cited in Higgins et al., 2002), when studying the 
process of tutoring by written correspondence at the Open University in the United Kingdom, 
identified that written feedback comments were often the major source of support for students. 
Higgins et al. (2002) identified variables related to the quality, quantity, timeliness, and language of 
comments as contributing to students’ understandings and utilisation of feedback.  

Results from The Open Polytechnic survey indicated that over 80 percent of students found all 
comments, whether on the script or in the feedback letter, informative.  

Because the Diploma of Teaching (ECE) courses are designed to be sequential steps within a holistic 
programme, feedback is applicable across the programme, rather than only to specific courses. When 
completing assignments, a large number of students (80 percent) used feedback from a range of 
courses. They identified that comments on the script were important. A slightly lower percentage 
indicated that opening and closing comments in the feedback letter, comments on content and on 
supporting evidence and, to a lesser degree, comments on structure, were important.  

Feedback that had programme-wide relevance was appreciated:  

Will look at comments on previous assignments in a strand. There are often references that can 
be cut and pasted, readings that can be used and comments that help. (Focus group) 

Many students discussed the ongoing benefit of knowledge gained about perspectives of 
learning and theories of human development. Courses with this content were positioned early 
in the programme, and students reported that they related their understanding to many 
subsequent courses. (Focus group) 

Some students found that feedback given for related courses was very useful. Survey results showed 
that students are more likely to refer to feedback from a related course (69 percent) or to their last 
feedback (66 percent) when they are completing assignments, rather than feedback from courses of 
the same level (56 percent), or all previous feedback (46 percent). They reported “looking back”, 
although mostly only within particular strands of the programme. However, some content was 
perceived to be “more general than specific for future usefulness” (focus group).  

Other students felt that feedback on one course was of minimal use to other courses. Sometimes this 
was due to the quality of the feedback: 

If people commented useful information instead of irrelevant comments which state the 
obvious. (Survey)  

Sometimes feedback was deemed to be of little value when a course had been completed—some 
students felt that feedback did not “feed forward”:  

Once it’s finished, it’s finished. (Focus group)  
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For the students who do not wait for the assignment feedback to come back from markers before 
they start the next assignment, the feedback is used mainly to consolidate current knowledge and for 
general guidance for a wide range of other courses. Hyland (2000) and Orsmond et al. (2002) also 
found that the majority of their respondents claimed to read feedback comments and to use them for 
subsequent assignments.  

Motivation 
Survey findings showed that students’ initial thoughts about the purposes of written feedback 
concerned, first and foremost, its use for improving their work. The next most important purpose 
concerned motivation to continue their study:  

I find the written feedback useful and encouraging. (Questionnaire) 

Feedback is so important. It gives me the confidence to tackle the next assignment. 
(Questionnaire) 

Students also indicated that particularly helpful comments in written feedback were those that 
motivate:  

I believe students like myself need specific comments that we can identify, understand and act 
on …. Also it is encouraging to receive comments that are amusing or just encouraging eg: yes, 
you have a good point here. Or ‘ka pai, well done’. (Questionnaire) 

In line with these findings, Higgins’s (2004) research suggests that feedback should help students to 
learn. This belief is also supported by Hyland (2000), who highlights that feedback is an important 
motivator.  

Type of feedback 
The survey data found that for 90 percent of students comments on improving work, identifying 
strengths and weaknesses, and explaining how learning outcomes were met or not met were 
important or very important in motivating them in their study:  

For a resubmit, the marker clearly told me what I had to do to meet the learning outcome. It is 
very helpful. It motivates me to continue my study. (Questionnaire) 

Comments relating to the structure of their work were important or very important for motivating 81 
percent of the students. Fewer students (66 percent) identified comments relating to the presentation 
of their work as important or very important for motivation. Ticks on the script were important or 
very important for motivation for 59 percent of students. These indicate that feedback is a very 
important vehicle to motivate students in their study, and that helpful comments relating to global 
feedback are motivational. However, some technical feedback may not necessarily motivate. 
Gallimore and Tharp (1990) and Hattie (2002) support this finding by stating that specific and 
constructive feedback assures that assessment practices impact positively on students’ motivation. 
Motivation comes from positive comments:  

All constructive criticism I have received has been given in a positive manner and I appreciate 
that. (Questionnaire)  

Motivation is also internal to the student. One student commented that the positive feedback “makes 
me want to do better” (survey). Ultimately, however, it is the student’s “own reasons for finishing 
the course” that are the motivating factor. Alton-Lee (2003) notes that negative feedback can have a 
negative impact on students’ motivation and engagement, whereas Orsmond et al. (2002) note that 
negative as well as positive feedback is likely to motivate students to develop a greater 
understanding of their subject. However, they say that a statement of weaknesses must be 
accompanied with an explanation of how to address them. 
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Table 7 shows that, in relation to motivation, global feedback (as opposed to technical feedback) is 
perceived to be very important by more students studying in Year 1 than in Year 3, and by the fewest 
in Year 2.  

Table 7 The importance of “global” feedback for motivation, by year level 

 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 

 (No.) (%) (No.) (%) (No.) (%) 

Important 0  13 20.6 3 10.3 

Very important 30 100.0 50 79.4 26 89.7 

Total 30 100.0 63 100.0 29 100.0 

N/R = 2; df = 2; Chi-square = 7.8503; p = 0.02 

One possible explanation for the non-linear patterns could be that more Year 2 than Year 1 or Year 3 
students already hold a tertiary qualification, and are more confident about undertaking tertiary 
study. They are also different from other year groups, in that 18 percent of them seldom or never 
read the feedback carefully (compared with 13 percent of students studying in Year 3 and none in 
Year 1). 

Grades 
There are strong links between grades and motivation in the survey. The results show that 81 percent 
of students find that the grade becomes a motivating factor when it is accompanied by justification 
of why it was awarded. Students suggest that markers should “justify the grade given. I enjoy my 
work being critiqued so that I can improve” (questionnaire).  

Yet some of these comments also make a link between motivation and grades. For example, 
previous feedback is used: 

as motivation to try harder and achieve higher grades. (Questionnaire) 

for personal motivation and to see if I have passed. (Questionnaire) 

Positive comments are always good on feedback sheet even if the mark you got wasn’t that 
good. (Questionnaire)  

In the focus group discussions, it was revealed that for some students written feedback provides 
motivation to get a higher grade, whereas for others, completion of the programme is their focus. 

With a slightly different emphasis, Swan and Arthurs’s study (1998) takes the view that grades are 
the prime motivator for students. However, they go on to say that feedback is linked to wanting to 
know how to make improvements to raise the mark. The findings from this research study do not 
support the belief that grades alone are the prime motivator. 

Findings from the present study also highlight factors that “demotivate” students. These include 
negative comments, inconsistent feedback, repetitive feedback, feedback without purpose, and 
untimely feedback. Timeliness of feedback is a point supported by Gibbs (1999), who argues that 
this has a significant impact on motivation.  

Relationships  
Students also commented that when their work was marked by people with whom they had a 
relationship, the comments were more meaningful. They also felt less confident about contacting 
markers with whom they did not have a relationship. One student said that she was more likely to 
take “on board” a marker’s written feedback if she knew the marker personally, rather than if the 
marker were anonymous.  
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When you know them it’s like having a photo to go with the name and the comments are more 
real. Especially when you have to ring them up. (Focus group) 

Getting to know the tutor makes studying easier. For example, personalised comments. (Focus 
group) 

It would be good if we could just meet. It just helps. I’ve met a few of them [regional 
lecturers]—then they know you and you can gel with them. It would be nice if you could meet 
with them (all). (Focus group) 

The Diploma of Teaching (ECE) uses a blended teaching and learning model that is taught from a 
distance by means of written learning materials, face-to-face workshops that are regionally 
delivered, and practicum and home centre requirements in early childhood centres. Students have a 
regional lecturer allocated to them who lives in the same area of New Zealand (or as close as 
possible). The regional lecturer provides mentoring support across the entire programme. The 
relationship is established at a four-day introductory workshop within the first few weeks of the 
student’s first semester in the programme, and continues with weekend workshops, study groups, ad 
hoc meetings, and practicum supervision. Students indicated that this relationship was of particular 
importance to them. One student who moved to a different area of New Zealand would travel back to 
her previous region for workshops, to maintain contact with the lecturer and her student colleagues. 
The value that students place on relationships, combined with the high retention rates of this 
programme (96.98 percent in Semester 2, 2005), indicate that personal support and mentorship is a 
critical component for student success, particularly in distance education. 

Students recognised that relationships are reciprocal. One student also proposed that “giving 
feedback might be more meaningful for markers if they had a relationship with the student” and that 
“personal contact/rapport allowed the tutor to relate better to the student” (focus group). 

I commend the markers on taking the required time to help us with future studies through 
comments given. (Questionnaire) 

Student cohorts 
Organising provincial, rural, and Māori focus groups was challenging because our students are 
dispersed throughout New Zealand. The attendance at these focus groups was consequently smaller. 
For example, although 10 percent of our students are Māori, there were only two “regions” that had 
more than eight Māori students, and within regions students may still have needed several hours of  
travel in order to meet. 

Overall, there was little difference between the Māori student focus group and the two general 
groups, or between the questionnaires from students who identified as Māori and other 
questionnaires. Māori students also affirmed the importance of communication with lecturers, 
contact with other students through workshops, change in feedback over time in the programme, 
focus on technical aspects of feedback, and the consistency of comments as factors of motivation.  

However, Mäori students also indicated a strong sense of self-responsibility, or self-blame, and the 
belief that “help” shouldn’t be necessary.  

[They] give me some ideas when I went off the track on the assessment—the notes helped me 
correct myself in the resubmit. (Questionnaire) 

Help me understand where I went wrong or what points I have missed out. (Questionnaire) 

There did not appear to be any significant differences between the urban and provincial focus 
groups. This may be because students still felt they had effective support from their regional lecturer. 
With the support of distance learning materials, a regional lecturer, and an effective distance library, 
access to a campus was not important. 
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Summary  
• Students’ reasons for study were influenced by changes in government regulations, but the 

primary motivation was interest in early childhood education as a career. 

• Students increased their pace of study (number of courses studied within a semester) between 
Year 1 and Year 3. 

• Students raised their level of achievement (improved their grades) between Year 1 and Year 3. 

• Pace and achievement variables significantly cross tabulated; that is, higher achievers moved 
through the courses at a faster pace. 

• Students who most valued the technical aspects of feedback were both fast paced and high 
achievers. Some students found that the focus on technical aspects of feedback was “picky”. 

• Students found both technical feedback and global feedback to be informative. Year 1 students 
particularly valued feedback. 

• Students expected and valued feedback that reflected their level, with more support in Year 1 and 
more challenge in Year 3. 

• Consistency in some aspects of feedback was appreciated—for example, in being positive. 

• Reflection was considered to be programme wide and related to the students’ personal learning 
and concurrent teaching. 

•  Students were frustrated by what they believed to be slow turnaround of assessment feedback 
and inconsistency in marking 

• Three-quarters (76 percent) of students read feedback carefully; feedback was read more 
carefully by older students. 

• If feedback was not understood, half the students would contact the marker. The next most 
common action was to contact regional lecturers. Some students were reluctant to call, having 
self-expectations of independence. 

• Feedback of programme-wide relevance was appreciated; students could use this feedback 
beyond a specific course. 

• Students considered that the most important purpose of assessment feedback was to improve their 
work. The second most important purpose was to motivate them in their study. Positive, 
encouraging comments were motivating. 

• Students wanted clear justification of their grades and wanted to know how to improve their 
work. Students were frustrated if they got a low mark, but only positive comments. Most students 
(81 percent) found that grades were motivating when accompanied by justification of the grade. 
Grades alone were not the prime motivator. 

• The importance of relationships with regional lecturers and student colleagues was clearly 
signalled. Students preferred to receive assessment feedback from lecturers whom they had met 
and with whom they had a relationship: “It’s like having a photo to go with the name and the 
comments are more real”. 

• There did not appear to be any difference between the issues discussed by rural students, Māori 
students, and the overall group. However, the focus groups for the sub-cohorts were small.  
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5. Building capability and capacity 

Participatory research model 

Defining participatory research 
Reason and Heron (1986) propose a model of co-operative or participatory research that differs from 
traditional positivist research in several aspects. A key underpinning of our use of participatory 
research is the recognition that the research “has a double objective; it aims to produce knowledge 
and action directly useful to people, and also to empower people through the process of constructing 
and using their own knowledge” (Shortall, 2003, p. 225). This dual approach was highly relevant to 
our study, as we had two main research purposes. First, we wanted to understand more about student 
perceptions of assessment feedback; second, we wanted the research process to enhance our wider 
team research culture and capability, and to empower our team. By “team”, we mean not only the 
research team, but the staff of the Centre for Education Studies, and other staff of the wider Open 
Polytechnic. 

Shortall (2003) links the emphasis on inquiry with empowerment, which aligns the participatory 
approach with the sociocultural underpinnings of Te Whāriki, the New Zealand early childhood 
curriculum. Our research focuses on student perceptions of the role of assessment feedback. We are 
not merely focusing on the role of assessment feedback, but are acknowledging that student 
perception of the role of assessment feedback is important for us to understand. We recognise that 
our understanding of the construct assessment feedback has only limited meaning and purpose, 
unless we understand the relevance of this construct for students. 

In participatory research, research participants engage directly in the research process, and are not 
just passively researched. Pragmatics meant that we used a postal survey questionnaire as one of our 
three main research methods. Student records were used to describe the demographic profile of 
students and to analyse progress. The third method was more qualitative, with focus group 
interviews of students. We extended that participatory research approach by offering professional 
development in focus group facilitation to our team of regional lecturers and others. The rationale for 
this was that: 

The methodologies that in orthodox research would be called research design, data gathering, 
data analysis and so on are on secondary to the emergent processes of collaboration and 
dialogue that empower, motivate, increase self-esteem and develop community solidarity. 
(Reason, 1994, p. 329) 

Indicators of participatory research include: 

• the rejection of positivism and aversion to empiricism 

• the avoidance of a hierarchical relationship between researcher and researched 

• the dismantling of academic monopoly on the definition and employment of knowledge  

• democracy in knowledge production, giving participants a stake in the quality of results 

• reflexivity, that is, unification of theory and practice 

• the likelihood of results being put into practice 

• researchers reflecting on and examining their own assumptions and methods 

• participants reflecting on and examining the value of knowledge to their everyday lives. 
(Shortall, 2003) 
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Comparing participatory research with other paradigm positions 
Lincoln and Guba (2000) place participatory research as the paradigm furthest from positivism, on 
the following continuum: 

positivism—postpositivism—critical theory—constructivism—participatory research 

The issue of “voice” illustrates the way in which our research position is a combination of 
constructivist and participatory positions. A positivist position of inquirer posture and voice would 
be as “disinterested scientist” and informer. The constructivist position, which is the position for 
inquirer posture closest to our research, is described as “passionate participant” and facilitator of 
“multivoice reconstruction”. The participatory position moves further to “aware self-reflective 
action” (Lincoln & Guba, 2000, p. 171). As researchers, it would be naïve of us not to acknowledge 
that the data is filtered through us and influenced by us. 

Training is an aspect of the research for which we were able to move further into the participatory 
paradigm. In positivism and postpositivism, theories are “technical and quantitative” (Lincoln & 
Guba, 2000). For critical theory and constructivism, training accommodates qualitative and 
quantitative elements, values, and empowerment. In the participatory approach: 

Coresearchers are initiated into the inquiry process by facilitator/researcher and learn through 
active engagement in the process; facilitator/researcher requires emotional competence, 
democratic personality and skills. (Lincoln & Guba, 2000, p. 171) 

Participatory research in action 
Aspects of our research that reflect the participatory approach included Dr Anne Meade’s 
mentorship and support—providing focus group training to our whole team and some other staff of 
the polytechnic, and regular updates to the team on the process of the research, not only the findings. 
Within the research team, responsibilities and tasks such as analysis were shared. Team leadership 
was also shared. Initially the team was led by Liz Everiss (until January 2005), then by Valerie 
Margrain (February−June and September 2005−January 2006), with Trish Murphy covering the 
period when Valerie was on leave (July and August 2005). 

Aspects of our research that involved a participatory relationship with lecturers included: 

• advice sought from regional lecturers in relation to the proposal, ethics application, questionnaire, 
and focus group organisation;  

• regular updates with lecturers by email, forums, and teleconference;  

• newsletters; 

• staff representation on the TLRI Advisory Committee; 

• focus group facilitation training offered to all lecturers as professional development; and 

• feedback of results to lecturers, including through forums. 

Participatory research approaches that included the wider Open Polytechnic included: 

• Māori, Design and Development Centre, and other centres’ representation on the Advisory 
Committee;  

• inclusion of staff beyond the Centre for Education Studies in training in focus group facilitation; 

• focus groups facilitated by polytechnic staff who were outside the Diploma of Teaching (Early 
Childhood Education) programme;  

• a presentation to The Open Polytechnic in August 2005 (Murphy, McClew, & Margrain, 1995); 
and 

• a working paper planned for 2006. 
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Participatory research should collaboratively include the research participants. This process will be 
particularly important when data have been analysed further. However, the following are examples 
of participatory approaches to date: 

• student representative on the Advisory Committee; 

• student newsletters; and 

• student involvement in focus groups. 

With the New Zealand Council for Educational Research (NZCER), our obligations were to 
complete agreed research milestones on time and to provide research reports every three months. In 
return, we were to be paid. However, a participatory approach allowed us to develop a more 
meaningful relationship. NZCER provided opportunities for research mentorship, advice, and 
guidance. We also agreed on a contract by which NZCER completed some statistical analyses for us, 
and collated qualitative data from the survey. The opportunity to work together in this sub-contract 
allowed us to do more extensive levels of analysis than we would have been able to carry out alone. 

Lincoln and Guba’s (2000) paradigm continuum can also be applied to research analysis. Positivist 
and postpositivist approaches centre on constructions of reliability and objectivity. Constructivist 
and participatory paradigms extend constructions of validity to include authenticity, ethics, 
communities of practice, and participant understanding. Participatory research would often ensure 
that these themes were shared with participants and debated further. The focus group aspect of our 
research allowed preliminary themes on assessment feedback to be “unpacked” and also debated 
further.  

Constant comparative analysis became a participatory process, because of the need to collaborate 
with co-researchers and colleagues to check interpretation and understanding. We found it easiest to 
code data with highlighters and keywords, and to work first individually, then in pairs, and finally in 
small groups to develop categories for analysis.  

Outcomes of participatory research 
Participatory research does not exist in a vacuum, but sits alongside broader research and teaching 
philosophy, beliefs and values, ethics, professional development, mentorship, and collegiality. A 
commitment to expanding our team research culture began with our previous manager, Liz Everiss, 
and continues with our current manager, Valerie Burns, and dean, Axel Laurs. The TLRI project 
grew from the original work of Trish Murphy, the vision of Liz Everiss, the guidance of Dr Anne 
Meade, the support of The Open Polytechnic, the activity of the research team, and the involvement 
of the Centre for Education Studies team and of colleagues in the wider Polytechnic.  

However, at the end of this project, what we produce in the way of research outputs (for example, 
Murphy, Margrain, & McClew, 2005) is only one result. Participatory research means that research 
functions “not only as a means of knowledge production but also as a tool for the education and 
development of consciousness as well as mobilization for action” (Gaventa, as cited in Babbie, 2001, 
p. 288). One of our colleagues (beyond the research team) responded to a forum on this research 
with the following comments: 

There are some really good points that I can learn from. (Staff forum, 31 October, 2005) 

There is enough food for thought here for a long time. (Staff forum, 31 October, 2005) 

Robson (2002) describes participatory research, participatory action research, and action research 
as synonyms, because of their shared focus on collaboration between the researchers and those who 
are the focus of the research, and their shared participation in the process (pp. 215−216). The 
emancipatory purpose of participatory research approaches means that it does not merely describe, 
understand, and explain. Fundamental aspects of the research include improvement of: 
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• practice; 

• understanding of a practice by its practitioners; and 

• the situation in which the practice takes place. 

The participatory approach used in the present study has the opportunity to lead to positive action for 
colleagues, student participants, other students, and our institution. Babbie (2001, p. 288) states, 
“Once people see themselves as researchers, they automatically regain power over knowledge.” 
Outcomes of such empowerment in The Open Polytechnic will influence our understanding of 
assessment feedback, our teaching, and our growth as researchers. In other words, the participatory 
research aspects of this study mean that we have expectations that “growing a research culture” will 
also result in change and development in terms of power, processes, and outcomes.  
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6. Limitations  
Limitations of this research project included: 

• The perspectives of rural students, Māori students, and students with languages other than 
English could have been explored further. 

• There was a disproportionate number of Year 2 students, although the use of percentages meant 
that their results did not bias findings. 

• Minimal attendance at two of our three focus groups meant that urban–provincial and Māori–
non-Māori comparisons could not be treated robustly. 

• The number of questionnaires (125) is a statistically small sample.  

• The return rate was 53 percent. Although acceptable, it also means that almost half the students 
eligible to comment did not provide feedback. 
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7. Recommendations 
In the light of the findings from this research, the following recommendations are proposed to guide 
tertiary teachers to provide more effective written feedback to students: 

1. Assessment is not an end point—view written feedback as an integral part of the teaching 
process. Reflect on pedagogical practice when considering the role of written feedback in the 
teaching and learning process.  

2. Use assessment feedback to empower and encourage students. However, justify comments and 
grades. Whenever possible, let the student know what they could have done better or differently 
to achieve a higher grade. When feedback is justified, it can motivate students.  

3. Ensure consistency between markers to enable students to use feedback across different courses. 
Maintain robust marking criteria.  

4. Ensure that work is returned to students promptly.  

5. Maintain open lines of communication through a range of media, so that the student can access 
support if needed. 

6. Further consider how to support and engage with Māori students, and how assessment feedback 
can align with tikanga Māori. 

Students’ relationships with The Open Polytechnic and its staff are a critical aspect of student 
experience and should be valued. These relationships also warrant further research. The study could 
be replicated with a “pure” distance programme, to see whether these relationships are equally 
important to students who have not had any face-to-face support. The students in this study have 
access to a course forum, but rarely use this medium of communication. Students who have 
electronic support and relationships may feel differently about the need for face-to-face interaction. 
Replication of the study could also be useful with cohorts of Māori, Pasifika, and international 
students. 
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Appendix 1: Questionnaire 
 

 
Title: Effective teacher education practice:  

The impact of written assessment ‘feedback’ for distance learners 
 

QUESTIONNAIRE 
 

Early Childhood Education Student Teachers 
Thank you for agreeing to complete this questionnaire and contribute to the 

research project. 
 

 

 

This questionnaire sets out to discover the value that students place on written feedback. Information 
will be gathered to examine whether students’ progress and retention are linked to their views on 
effective feedback approaches. Students’ perceptions of the role of written feedback will help to 
identify how improvements can be made to enhance teaching and learning.  

Student information:  Remember that the following information has been collected from your 
student file at The Open Polytechnic:  

• Your grades 

• Your year of study 

• The pace at which you are working through the programme 

Please note: The information collected in this questionnaire will remain anonymous. 

All participants hold the right to withdraw from the research pilot without penalty or reason at any 
stage. 

Please return this completed questionnaire by 31 May, 2005.  
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STUDENT CHARACTERISTICS 

The questions in this section of the questionnaire will help us to identify the extent to which students 
with different characteristics have different views about written feedback.  

PLEASE TICK YOUR RESPONSE 

1. What year of the Diploma of Teaching (ECE) are you currently in? 

Year 1 (enrolled in level 5 courses and 2 or less level 6 courses?) 

Year 2 (enrolled in 3 or more level 6 courses and 2 or less level 7 courses?) 

Year 3 (enrolled in 3 or more level 7 courses?) 

 

2. What is your age bracket? 

Under 20   

20–25 years   

26–30 years   

31–40 years   

40–50 years 

Over 50 years 

 

3. Which ethnic group do you identify with?  (You ma

NZ European  NZ

Samoan  Co

Tongan  Ni

Tokelau  Fi

Other Pacific Nation  Ch

Indian  

Other (Please state)   
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4. What is your first language? (Please tick one) 

English  NZ

Samoan  Co

Tongan  Ni

Tokelau  Fi

Cantonese  M

Other (Please state)   

 

 

 

 

 

 

y tick all that apply) 

 Māori  

ok Island Māori  

uean  

jian   

inese  

 

 Māori  

ok Island Māori  

uean  

jian   

andarin  
 

 

 

 



 

5. When you first enrolled in the Diploma, how long had it been since you had done any study? 

Under 1 year 

1 year 

2 to 5 years 

More than 5 years 

 

 

 

 

 

6. What is your highest school qualification? (Tick one only)  

Finished primary school 

Some years at secondary school 

School certificate subjects 

Sixth form certificate 

University Entrance 

Higher school certificate 

Bursary 

Other 

 
 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

7. What is the highest qualification you have completed since leaving school?  (Please describe) 
 

 

 

8. What were your main reasons for deciding to study for a Diploma of Teaching ECE? Please rate 
each statement below on a 1 to 5 scale, with (1) being very important and (5) being not at all 
important. (Please circle) 

Very Important Important Neutral Not important Not at all important 

1 2 3 4 5 

 

Wanted to be an early childhood teacher   1 2 3 4 5 
Love of learning      1 2 3 4 5 
Love of young children     1 2 3 4 5 
Needed the qualification to keep my job   1 2 3 4 5 
To upgrade my qualification because of 
Government requirements    1 2 3 4 5 
To support my centre to remain open   1 2 3 4 5 
Fees were paid by my work.    1 2 3 4 5 
Any other reason (please specify below)   1 2 3 4 5 
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VALUE OF FEEDBACK 

In this section of the questionnaire we want to find out whether you find written feedback useful and 
what you value about written feedback.  

(Written feedback comprises feedback sheets from the marker and comments on your script.) 

 
9. What are your initial thoughts about the written feedback that you receive on The Open 

Polytechnic of New Zealand’s assessments? 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

10. How is written feedback useful to you?  Please rate each statement below on a 1 to 5 scale, with 
(1) being very important and (5) being not at all important (please circle). 

 

Very Important Important Neutral Not important Not at all important 

1 2 3 4 5 

 

It identifies strengths and weaknesses in my work  1 2 3 4 5 

It deepens my understanding of what is meant in 
assessment questions     1 2 3 4 5 

It helps me to understand the potential application 
of the content      1 2 3 4 5 

It helps me to review my progress    1 2 3 4 5 

It helps me to learn about what markers want  1 2 3 4 5 

It motivates me to go for better grades   1 2 3 4 5 

It motivates me to continue my studies   1 2 3 4 5 

It builds my confidence      1 2 3 4 5 

It encourages me to become an independent learner 1 2 3 4 5 

It tells me the grade I received    1 2 3 4 5 

Other (please specify below)    1 2 3 4 5 
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NATURE OF FEEDBACK/CONTENT 

In this section of the questionnaire we ask you to identify the characteristics of written feedback that 
you find most helpful to your ongoing learning and writing of assessments. 

 
11. To motivate you in your study, what type of comments in the feedback sheet or the script do 

you consider to be helpful? Please rate each statement below on a 1 to 5 scale, with (1) being 
very important and (5) being not at all important. (Please circle) 

Very Important Important Neutral Not important Not at all important 

1 2 3 4 5 

 

Comments on the level of the work in relation 
to the level of the course     1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that focus on the marker’s overall 
impression      1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that explain how the learning  
outcomes of the assessment have been met/  1 2 3 4 5 
not met 

Comments that identify strengths    1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that identify where improvement 
is needed      1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that focus on the argument   1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that focus on the subject matter   1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that focus on the use of supporting 
evidence      1 2 3 4 5 

Comments on the structure of the assessment  1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that provide justification for the 
grade given      1 2 3 4 5 

Comments on the presentation of the assessment  1 2 3 4 5 

Written comments on your script    1 2 3 4 5 

Reflective questions on your script   1 2 3 4 5 

Ticks on the script     1 2 3 4 5 

Other (please specify below)    1 2 3 4 5 
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12. For improving your work, what type of comments in the feedback sheet or on the script do you 
consider to be helpful? Please rate each statement below on a 1 to 5 scale, with (1) being very 
important and (5) being not at all important. (Please circle) 

 

Very Important Important Neutral Not important Not at all important 

1 2 3 4 5 

 

Comments on the level of your work in relation to:  

The level of the course     1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that focus on the marker’s overall  
impression      1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that explain how the learning outcomes 

of the assessment have been met/not met   1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that identify strengths    1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that identify where improvement is 
needed        1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that focus on the argument   1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that focus on the subject matter   1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that focus on the use of supporting  
evidence      1 2 3 4 5 

Comments on the structure of the assessment  1 2 3 4 5 

Comments that provide justification for the  
grade given      1 2 3 4 5 

Comments on the presentation of your work  1 2 3 4 5 

Written comments on the script    1 2 3 4 5 

Reflective questions on the script    1 2 3 4 5 

Ticks on the script     1 2 3 4 5 

Other (please specify below)    1 2 3 4 5 
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13. Please provide one comment from your Diploma feedback sheets or scripts which has been 
particularly helpful to you?  Why?   

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
TIMING OF FEEDBACK  

This section of the questionnaire will provide us with information on how your progress in 
completing the courses is affected by time-frames of returning marked assessments. Please tick your 
response. 

14. On average, how long does it take for your marked assessments to be returned? 

Under 1 week 
 
1 week 
 
2 weeks 
 
3 weeks 
 
4 or more weeks 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Comments: 

15. Do you wait for feedback from your previous assessment before starting on the following one?   

 
Yes, always 
 
Yes, if it’s the    
same course 
 
No        
 
Sometimes 

 

 

 

 

If you answered “yes” or “sometimes” to Question 15, please comment on why below. 
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If you answered “no” to Question 15, please go to Question 15a 

15a. How do you use the feedback? 

 

 

 

 

 

RECEIVING FEEDBACK   

In this section of the questionnaire we wish to know what you do with your written feedback when 
you first receive it and the nature of any follow-up actions that you may take.  

 
16. What do you usually do with written feedback when you first receive it? Please rate each 

statement below on a 1 to 5 scale, with (1) being always and (5) being never.  (Please circle) 

 
Always Usually Sometimes Seldom Never 

1 2 3 4 5 

 
I leave it unopened      1 2 3 4 5 

Look at mark only and don’t read the comments 1 2 3 4 5 

Skim read the feedback    1 2 3 4 5 

Read the feedback carefully     1 2 3 4 5 

 

 

17. How much time do you usually spend on average reading your feedback when you first receive 
it? (Please tick one) 

Under 5 minutes 

5–9 minutes 

10–14 minutes 

15–30 minutes 

More than 30 minutes 

I don’t read it 
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18. In what order do you read your feedback when you first receive it? Please rate each statement 
below on a 1 to 5 scale, with (1) being read first and (5) being never read. (Please circle) 

Read First Read Second Read Later Read Last Never Read 

1 2 3 4 5 

 
Comments on script      1 2 3 4 5 

Feedback sheet - specific comments 
on structure etc      1 2 3 4 5 

Feedback sheet -general comments at the end  1 2 3 4 5 

Mark        1 2 3 4 5 

 
 
19. Which part of the feedback do you usually find most informative? Please rate each statement 

below on a 1 to 5 scale, with (1) being very important and (5) being not at all important. (Please 
circle) 

Very Important Important Neutral Not Important Not at all 
Important 

1 2 3 4 5 

 

Comments on script      1 2 3 4 5 

Feedback sheet- specific comments  
on structure etc      1 2 3 4 5 

Feedback sheet-general comment at end   1 2 3 4 5 

Mark        1 2 3 4 5 

 

20. What is the most likely action you will take if you do not understand a marker’s feedback or have 
difficulty with actioning suggestions? Please comment. 
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USE OF FEEDBACK 

This section of the questionnaire provides information on how useful the written feedback is for 
completing new assessments.  

21. Do you consider previous written feedback when completing new assessments? Please rate each 
statement below on a 1 to 5 scale, with (1) being always and (5) being never. (Please circle) 

Always Usually Sometimes Seldom Never 

1 2 3 4 5 

 

Last feedback      1 2 3 4 5 

All previous feedback     1 2 3 4 5 

Feedback for related courses    1 2 3 4 5 

Feedback for courses at the same level     1 2 3 4 5 

 

22. What parts of the feedback do you find most helpful for completing other assessments? Please 
rate each statement below on a 1 to 5 scale, with (1) being very important and (5) being not at all 
important. (Please circle) 

Very Important Important Neutral Not Important Not at all 
Important 

1 2 3 4 5 

 

Opening and closing comments   1 2 3 4 5 

Content      1 2 3 4 5 

Supporting evidence    1 2 3 4 5 

Structure      1 2 3 4 5 

Presentation     1 2 3 4 5 

Mark for each section    1 2 3 4 5 

Comments on script    1 2 3 4 5 

(Please comment below) 
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23. If you have been required to resubmit work, how did the feedback support you to complete this 
successfully?   

Please comment below. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

GENERAL 

This section of the questionnaire asks you to identify any improvements that we can make to the 
written feedback provided by markers and also provides an opportunity for you to provide additional 
comment on our written feedback processes. 

24. What can markers do to improve written feedback? (Please comment below) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 
25. Is there any other comment you wish to make about the written feedback process? (Please 

comment below) 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

Thank you for completing this questionnaire, and good luck with your study. 
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Appendix 2: Information sheet for participants 
 

Information Sheet for Participants 
 

Title: Effective teacher education practice: the impact of written assessment ‘feedback’ for 
distance learners. 

Centre for early Childhood Education, The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand, 2004. 

 

Kia ora 

This information sheet is to tell you about a research project being conducted at The Open 
Polytechnic and to invite you to participate. 

What is the research about? 

The Centre for Early Childhood Education is interested in finding out students’ views on the 
effectiveness of feedback both on scripts and in feedback letters. A greater understanding of what 
students term as effective feedback will enhance the ability of the Early Childhood Lecturers to 
support and/or extend the learning of students. 

The research objectives are to: 

• Examine students’ views on how the extent and immediacy of feedback supports their study 
and/or extends their learning. 

• Identify the characteristics and methods of the feedback that students find most effective in 
supporting their study and/or extending their learning. 

• Examine whether student characteristics are linked to student views on effective feedback 
approaches for supporting and/or extending their learning. 

• Examine whether student progress and retention are linked to student views on effective feedback 
approaches for supporting and/or extending their learning. 

• Involve ECE lecturers in the research processes to enhance their appreciation of evidence-based 
teaching practices and to build their research capability. 

What will the research involve? 

Students who have received feedback from at least five assessments will be asked to participate. 

Students that agree to participate will complete a short questionnaire. The student will be identifiable 
in the questionnaire in order to align responses to student records. 

The questionnaire will focus on how students perceive feedback, how the type of feedback and when 
they receive it aids in their learning. 

Students who do not agree will not be required to participate. 

Data will be collected from the student’s records and aligned with their responses in the 
questionnaire to determine whether student progress and retention are linked to student views on 
effective feedback approaches for supporting and/or extending their learning. The data collected will 
be your grades, your year of study and the pace at which you are working through the programme. 

The student has the right to withdraw from the research at any stage. 
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What will happen to the information? 

Original data will be securely kept at The Open Polytechnic during the research project. No 
individual statement will be able to be traced to any particular participant. 

Key findings will be sent to any research participants who are interested, with brief summaries also 
noted in the student newsletter. 

Overall information and key findings will be shared with relevant staff, but they will not be able to 
trace individual comments. 

Key findings may also be presented at conferences or in journals for professionals interested in 
effective feedback for distance students and/or student teachers. 

Who is conducting the research? 

Valerie Margrain, Dr Anne Meade, Trish Murphy, Jenny McClew, Angela Edlin and Liz Everiss. 

Contact details   

The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand, phone: 0508650200. Valerie Margrain: ext 5844, Trish 
Murphy: ext 4653, Jenny McClew: ext 4649. 

Do I have to participate in the research project? 

No, you do not have to participate in the research if you do not wish to. Participation is entirely 
voluntary. Only students who agree and sign consent forms will participate. 

Even if you do agree, you can change your mind and withdraw at any time, without having to 
provide a reason. 

What if I have any questions about the research? 

Your questions or comments are most welcome and please feel free to call the researchers. 

If you agree to participate in the research, please complete the Consent Form attached and return it in 
the postage paid envelope to The Centre For Early Childhood Education. 
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Appendix 3: Consent form 
Effective teacher education practice: the impact of written assessment 

PARTICIPANT PERMISSION FORM 

CONSENT TO RESEARCH PARTICIPATION with The Open Polytechnic of NZ 

Research Team:  Valerie Margrain, Dr Anne Meade, Trish Muirhead, Jenny McClew, 
Angela Edlin, Liz Everiss. 

 

• I have received an information sheet describing the research and introducing the researcher. I 
know that I can contact the research team to ask any further questions. 

• I understand that I may withdraw myself, or any information I have provided, from the 
research—I can do this at any stage until the end of data collection without penalty or need to 
provide reasons. 

• I understand the research methods include a written questionnaire and examination of student 
records (grades, year of study, and pace working through the programme). Some students may 
subsequently be invited to participate in focus group discussions—separate consent would be 
obtained for this phase. 

• I understand that any information gathered will be kept anonymous. My comments will not be 
identifiable to anyone other than the research leader and research assistant. 

 

Please tick if relevant: 

 I am willing to complete the questionnaire 

 I agree for data to be collected from my records (codes will be used instead of names) 

 I would like to receive a summary of the research when it is completed. 

Signed:______________________________________         

Name:________________________________________________ 

Date:_____________________ Student ID: ___________________________ 
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Appendix 4: Focus group questions 
TLRI Focus Group Questions (Appreciative Enquiry Approach) as at 1.7.05 

 

Introduction round—name/year of study 

 

1. What is assessment for?  BRAINSTORM ON WHITEBOARD 

Probe—learning for what? 

 

2. Some of the questionnaire answers talked about technical aspects of assignments and some about 
content and theoretical aspects of learning. 

I’d like to explore your views of the different aspects of feedback. 

Probe—do the different aspects vary in importance by year of study? 

 

3. What are the key messages from the written feedback that help you across all your study?  

(silence) 

 

4. In what way is written feedback part of dialogue with TOP staff? 

Probe:— how accessible are markers to you? 

 

5. Scales: challenge--------------------support 

corrective--------------------affirming 

Probes—Does this change by level of the programme 

 Does the tone of comments affect where on continuum 

    

6. How do grades help your learning? 

Probe—confidence and/ or motivation 

 

7. These are the threads I’ve heard—do they provide an adequate summary? 

 

Footnote: If consistency comes up as an issue, ask for examples/ask for solutions 
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Appendix 5: Information sheet for focus group 
participants 

Supplementary Information Sheet for Focus Group Participants  

 

Title: Effective teacher education practice: the impact of written assessment ‘feedback’ for 
distance learners. 

 

Centre for early Childhood Education, The Open Polytechnic of New Zealand, 2004. 

 

Kia ora 

This information sheet is to tell you about the focus groups as part of the research project being 
conducted at The Open Polytechnic for which you have already completed a questionnaire. We 
would like to invite you to participate in a focus group with other Diploma of Teaching (ECE) 
students. 

The focus group is being held at ____________________________(venue) 

Start time:___________________  Finish time:_______________________ 

Light refreshments will be provided. 

A reminder of what is the research is about 

The Centre for Early Childhood Education is interested in finding out students’ views on the 
effectiveness of feedback both on scripts and in feedback letters. A greater understanding of what 
students term as effective feedback will enhance the ability of the Early Childhood Lecturers to 
support and/or extend the learning of students. 

The research objectives are to: 

• Examine students’ views on how the extent and immediacy of feedback supports their study 
and/or extends their learning. 

• Identify the characteristics and methods of the feedback that students find most effective in 
supporting their study and/or extending their learning. 

• Examine whether student characteristics are linked to student views on effective feedback 
approaches for supporting and/or extending their learning. 

• Examine whether student progress and retention are linked to student views on effective feedback 
approaches for supporting and/or extending their learning. 

• Involve ECE lecturers in the research processes to enhance their appreciation of evidence-based 
teaching practices and to build their research capability. 

What will the focus group involve? 

• Students who have completed a questionnaire, and who live in particular geographic regions, will 
be semi-randomly selected to participate in a focus group. 

• The focus group will consist of 6–12 students and two facilitators. 
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• Focus group facilitators will encourage discussion amongst participants regarding themes that 
have been drawn from the questionnaires. 

• One of the focus groups will specifically include Māori participants. 

• Any student has the right to withdraw from the research at any stage, however once data has been 
collated then it will be more difficult to extract individual data.  

What will happen to the information? 

• Original data will be securely kept at The Open Polytechnic during the research project. No 
individual statement will be able to be traced to any particular participant. 

• Key findings will be sent to any research participants who are interested, with brief summaries 
also noted in the student newsletter. 

• Overall information and key findings will be shared with relevant staff, but they will not be able 
to trace individual comments. 

• Key findings may also be presented at conferences or in journals for professionals interested in 
effective feedback for distance students and/or student teachers. 

Who is conducting the research? 

• Valerie Margrain, Programme Leader of the Centre For Education Studies 

• Dr Anne Meade, Research Fellow for The Open Polytechnic of NZ 

• Angela Edlin, Regional Lecturer for the Centre for Education Studies 

• Trish Muirhead, Regional Lecturer for the Centre for Education Studies 

• Jenny McClew, Regional Lecturer for the Centre for Education Studies 

• Liz Everiss, former Manager for the Centre for Education Studies 

Do I have to participate in the research project? 

No, you do not have to participate in the research if you do not wish to. Participation is entirely 
voluntary. Only students who agree and sign consent forms will participate. 

Even if you do agree, you can change your mind and withdraw at any time, without having to 
provide a reason. 

What if I have any questions about the research? 

Your questions or comments are most welcome and please feel free to call Trish Muirhead, Jenny 
McClew, Angela Edlin or Valerie Margrain in the research team. 

If you agree to participate in the research, please complete the Consent Form attached and return it in 
the postage paid envelope to The Centre for Education Studies. 

Thank you. 
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Appendix 6: Consent form for focus group 
participants 
Effective teacher education practice: the impact of written assessment 

PARTICIPANT PERMISSION FORM for FOCUS GROUPS 

 

CONSENT TO RESEARCH PARTICIPATION with The Open Polytechnic of NZ 

Research Team: Valerie Margrain, Dr Anne Meade, Trish Muirhead, Jenny McClew, 
Angela Edlin, Liz Everiss. 

 

• I have received a supplementary information sheet describing the focus group component of the 
research.  I know that I can contact the research team to ask any further questions. 

• I understand that I may withdraw myself, or any information I have provided, from the research - 
I can do this at any stage until the end of data collection without penalty or need to provide 
reasons. 

• I understand that the focus groups involve attending a venue in my region for about two hours, 
with other Diploma of Teaching (ECE) students. Facilitators will invite group discussion of 
some of the themes drawn from the earlier questionnaire. 

• I understand that any records of information gathered will be kept anonymous. My comments 
will not be identifiable to anyone other than the research leader and administration assistant. 

• I understand that participants in the focus group will agree on a group contract at the beginning of 
the focus group. It will include keeping the names of the people in attendance confidential and 
non attributing specific statements to individuals in a way that might mean they are identified 
and lose their anonymity. 

• I understand that there is no payment for attending a focus group, but I may be reimbursed up to 
$20 for travel expenses. 

 

Please tick if relevant: 

 I am willing to participate in the focus group on _____________________(date) at 
_____________________(venue). 

 I would like to receive a summary of the research when it is completed. 

Signed:______________________________________         

Name:________________________________________________ 

Date: _____________________ Student ID: ___________________________ 
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Appendix 7: Excerpt from data for constructed 
variables “pace” and “achievement” 

 

Table 8 Percentage at each level of pace by year level of course 

Level of pace Year 1 (n = 30) Year 2 (n = 63) Year 3 (n = 31) 

Slow 47 16 0 

Medium 47 67 68 

Fast 7 16 26 

Overall 24 50 25 

Percentages do not add up to 100 because of rounding of numbers and missing data. 

 

Table 9 Summary characteristics of pace 

Sample statistic Value 

n 121 

Mean (standard deviation) 5.8 (1.6) 

Minimum 2.0 

Lower quartile 4.7 

Median 5.5 

Upper quartile 7.0 

Maximum 9.0 

 

Table 10 Summary characteristics of achievement 

Sample statistic Value 

n 121 

Mean (standard deviation) 12.9 (4.3) 

Minimum 3.0 

Lower quartile 10.0 

Median 12.7 

Upper quartile 16.0 

Maximum 22.0 
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